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Since the end of apartheid, South Africa has become an extreme yet unexceptional embodiment of forces at
play in many other regions of the world: intensifying inequality alongside “wageless life,” proliferating
forms of protest and populist politics that move in different directions, and official efforts at containment
ranging from liberal interventions targeting specific populations to increasingly common police brutality.

Rethinking the South African Crisis revisits long-standing debates to shed new light on the transition from
apartheid. Drawing on nearly twenty years of ethnographic research, Hart argues that local government has
become the key site of contradictions. Local practices, conflicts, and struggles in the arenas of everyday life
feed into and are shaped by simultaneous processes of de-nationalization and re-nationalization. Together
they are key to understanding the erosion of African National Congress hegemony and the proliferation of
populist politics.

This book provides an innovative analysis of the ongoing, unstable, and unresolved crisis in South Africa
today. It also suggests how Antonio Gramsci’s concept of passive revolution, adapted and translated for
present circumstances with the help of philosopher and liberation activist Frantz Fanon, can do useful
analytical and political work in South Africa and beyond.
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From reader reviews:

Anna Thompson:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With looking at you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world may share their idea.
Publications can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire their particular reader with
their story or perhaps their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the publications. But also they
write about the information about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how
to teach children, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on this planet always try to
improve their talent in writing, they also doing some research before they write to their book. One of them is
this Rethinking the South African Crisis: Nationalism, Populism, Hegemony (Geographies of Justice and
Social Transformation Ser.).

Colleen Nguyen:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their family, or their
friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, planning to beach, or picnic from the park.
They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something different to fill
your own personal free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book can be option to fill your no cost time/
holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want to try out
look for book, may be the e-book untitled Rethinking the South African Crisis: Nationalism, Populism,
Hegemony (Geographies of Justice and Social Transformation Ser.) can be fine book to read. May be it may
be best activity to you.

Tracy Zapata:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Rethinking the South African Crisis:
Nationalism, Populism, Hegemony (Geographies of Justice and Social Transformation Ser.) was bright
colored and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book Rethinking the South African
Crisis: Nationalism, Populism, Hegemony (Geographies of Justice and Social Transformation Ser.) has many
kinds or genre. Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and
feel that you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are make you bored, any it can make you
feel happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best book for you and try to like reading this.

Jim Molnar:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got learners? We believe that that query was
given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. So you know that
little person just like reading or as reading become their hobby. You should know that reading is very
important in addition to book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your
current teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update concerning something by book. Numerous



books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is niagra Rethinking the South African Crisis:
Nationalism, Populism, Hegemony (Geographies of Justice and Social Transformation Ser.).
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