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A leading consumer advocate reveals how to protect your money, time, and integrity from corrupt
businesses

Once upon a time store prices were simple and fair, businesses stood behind their products with guarantees
free of fine print and loopholes, and companies genuinely seemed to care about their valued customers—but
those days are long gone. In this groundbreaking exposé, consumer advocate Christopher Elliot reveals the
broken relationship between American consumers and businesses and explains how companies came to
believe that fooling their customers was a viable, and profitable, business plan.

Scammed explores how companies control information to mislead, distort the truth, and even outright lie to
their consumers.

Exposes the various ways companies have led their war against information—from seductive ads,●

disingenuous fine print, and unconventional promotions that involve seeding discussion forums and blogs
with company-friendly comments
Offers consumers insider knowledge of the system, reasonable expectations, and a clear understanding of●

the games businesses play
Christopher Elliott is one of the nation's foremost consumer advocates●

Protect yourself, your time, and your money from the predators of the consumer world. Armed with
knowledge, readers will become far more discerning and every business's worst nightmare.
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From reader reviews:

Kimberly Kiser:

The experience that you get from Scammed: How to Save Your Money and Find Better Service in a World
of Schemes, Swindles, and Shady Deals is the more deep you rooting the information that hide inside the
words the more you get thinking about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to recognise but
Scammed: How to Save Your Money and Find Better Service in a World of Schemes, Swindles, and Shady
Deals giving you thrill feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in a number of way that can be
understood by simply anyone who read this because the author of this guide is well-known enough. This
particular book also makes your vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand then can go along
with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We suggest you for having that Scammed: How to
Save Your Money and Find Better Service in a World of Schemes, Swindles, and Shady Deals instantly.

Barbara Davis:

The book untitled Scammed: How to Save Your Money and Find Better Service in a World of Schemes,
Swindles, and Shady Deals contain a lot of information on that. The writer explains the woman idea with
easy method. The language is very easy to understand all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read
the idea. The book was written by famous author. The author will bring you in the new time of literary
works. It is easy to read this book because you can please read on your smart phone, or gadget, so you can
read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can
open their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice learn.

David Dabbs:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information simpler to
share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon. You can
view that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. Typically the book that recommended to
your account is Scammed: How to Save Your Money and Find Better Service in a World of Schemes,
Swindles, and Shady Deals this reserve consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world now.
This kind of book was represented so why is the world has grown up. The language styles that writer use to
explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer made some investigation when he makes this book. That's
why this book suited all of you.

Helen McClain:

Beside this specific Scammed: How to Save Your Money and Find Better Service in a World of Schemes,
Swindles, and Shady Deals in your phone, it may give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or
information. The information and the knowledge you may got here is fresh from your oven so don't become
worry if you feel like an previous people live in narrow commune. It is good thing to have Scammed: How to



Save Your Money and Find Better Service in a World of Schemes, Swindles, and Shady Deals because this
book offers to you personally readable information. Do you at times have book but you seldom get what it's
interesting features of. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this inside your hand. The
Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to
miss the item? Find this book in addition to read it from now!
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