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In this poetic memoir of a rough and tumble life, from her backwoods childhood without boundaries to a
California urban adulthood filled with triumphs and disasters, Cassandra Dallett spares no details in a poetry
memoir that reads like the love child of Charles Bukowski and Elizabeth Bishop. These are stories of an
outsider, a perpetual misfit, offering a ceasefire in the war she wages with herself.

Cassandra Dallett's work has appeared in Slip Stream, Sparkle and Blink, Rusty Truck, Hip Mama, and the
Criminal Class Review, among other publications. She currently occupies Oakland, California.
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From reader reviews:

Stanley Wells:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add
your knowledge by the reserve entitled Wet Reckless. Try to make book Wet Reckless as your pal. It means
that it can for being your friend when you feel alone and beside associated with course make you smarter
than in the past. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you personally. The book makes you much more confidence
because you can know almost everything by the book. So , we should make new experience and knowledge
with this book.

Dorothy Frazier:

Now a day those who Living in the era just where everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not require people to be aware of each data they get. How people have to be
smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Reading through a book
can help persons out of this uncertainty Information specifically this Wet Reckless book because book offers
you rich info and knowledge. Of course the info in this book hundred percent guarantees there is no doubt in
it you may already know.

Robert Brown:

The knowledge that you get from Wet Reckless will be the more deep you excavating the information that
hide inside the words the more you get considering reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to
comprehend but Wet Reckless giving you enjoyment feeling of reading. The article author conveys their
point in certain way that can be understood through anyone who read it because the author of this book is
well-known enough. This kind of book also makes your own personal vocabulary increase well. So it is easy
to understand then can go with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We propose you for having
that Wet Reckless instantly.

Walter Pyle:

Is it you actually who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by watching television programs or
just resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Wet Reckless can be the reply, oh how
comes? It's a book you know. You are so out of date, spending your free time by reading in this brand-new
era is common not a nerd activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?
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