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War in the 18th century war was a complex operation, including popular as well as conventional conflict,
between Europeans and with non-Europeans. These conflicts influenced European intellectuals and
contributed to the complexity of Enlightenment thought. While Enlightenment writers regarded war as the
greatest evil confronting mankind, they had little hope that it could be eliminated; thus, peace proposals of
the day were joined by more realistic discussion of the means by which war might be limited or rendered
more humane. In this book, the author considers the influence of ideas and values on the actions of
Enlightenment military personnel and how the rational spirit of the time influenced military thought,
producing a military enlightenment that applied rational analysis to military tactics and to the composition of
armies. In the late Enlightenment, military writers explored the psychological foundations of war as a means
of stimulating a new military spirit among the troops.

The Enlightenment was, however, not the only cultural influence upon war during this century. Religion, the
traditional values of the ancien regime, and local values all contributed to the culture of force. When
Europeans engaged in military encounters with peoples in other parts of the globe, cultural interchange
inevitably occurred as well. Further, there is a revolutionary element that one must consider when defining
the military culture. The result of all these factors was a creative tension in 18th century warfare and an
extraordinarily complex military culture.
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From reader reviews:

Philip Logan:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information today can get by anyone with everywhere.
The information can be a understanding or any news even a huge concern. What people must be consider
whenever those information which is within the former life are challenging be find than now is taking
seriously which one would work to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you find the
unstable resource then you obtain it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen with you if you take War in the Age of the Enlightenment, 1700-1789
(Studies in Military History and International Affairs,) as the daily resource information.

Elijah McWhorter:

The publication with title War in the Age of the Enlightenment, 1700-1789 (Studies in Military History and
International Affairs,) includes a lot of information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of benefit after
read this book. This specific book exist new understanding the information that exist in this publication
represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to understand how the
improvement of the world. This particular book will bring you inside new era of the the positive effect. You
can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Elizabeth Black:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to pick book like
comic, brief story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not trying War in the Age of the
Enlightenment, 1700-1789 (Studies in Military History and International Affairs,) that give your
entertainment preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading routine all over the world
can be said as the opportunity for people to know world considerably better then how they react towards the
world. It can't be stated constantly that reading habit only for the geeky man but for all of you who wants to
always be success person. So , for all you who want to start reading through as your good habit, you could
pick War in the Age of the Enlightenment, 1700-1789 (Studies in Military History and International Affairs,)
become your starter.

Francis Lopez:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information from
the book. Book is composed or printed or created from each source that will filled update of news. Within
this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media social
like newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic. You can add your
knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just searching
for the War in the Age of the Enlightenment, 1700-1789 (Studies in Military History and International
Affairs,) when you desired it?
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