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The book discusses the Chilean earthquake that occurred on 27 February 2010. It reached a magnitude of 8.8
Mw and had its epicentre in Cobquecura, in the Bío- Bío region. The phenomenon mainly affected central
Chile, which comprises the regions of Araucaná, Bío-Bío, Maule, General O'Higgins, Valparaíso and
Metropolitan. As of February 2010 it was the fifth largest earthquake ever to have occurred on a worldwide
scale. The book presents a comprehensive view of the occurrence, being organized in six chapters written by
remarkable authors from different disciplines. The contributions come from the fields of geophysics, hydro-
mechanical engineering, telecommunication, geographic information systems, urban and design planning,
building engineering, architecture and urbanism. Authors from academia and the public and private sectors
give an idea of complementary approaches that range from theoretical descriptions to practice and
emergency solutions. Up to date coverage includes a compilation of regulations related to earthquake-
resistance standards and proposals for reconstruction and mitigation. Contents will be useful in preparing for
the next large-scale earthquake that is predicted for Chile some time in the next 15 years. The book will be
useful for researchers, professional engineers, government decision makers, and teachers at university levels.
It will also be suitable for undergraduates and postgraduates students. Contents include: Introduction Chapter
1: The Maule Mw 8.8 earthquake: a seismological view Chapter 2: Using remote sensing and geographic
information systems to contribute to earthquake disaster management Chapter 3: Tsunami generation and
propagation Chapter 4: Lessons to be learnt from architectural damage on urban settlement:in Chile Chapter
5: The reconstruction process of coastal cities in the north of the Biobio region: sustainability, participation
and resilience Chapter 6: The Chilean Internet: Did it survive to the earthquake?
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From reader reviews:

Floretta Simmons:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to find out everything in the world. Each book has different aim or even goal; it means that
publication has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. These are reading
whatever they have because their hobby is usually reading a book. Consider the person who don't like
looking at a book? Sometime, individual feel need book whenever they found difficult problem or perhaps
exercise. Well, probably you will require this The Chilean Earthquake and Tsunami 2010: A
Multidisciplinary Study of Mw8.8, Maule (WIT Transactions on State-of-the-art in Science and
Engineering).

Christina Mundell:

The guide with title The Chilean Earthquake and Tsunami 2010: A Multidisciplinary Study of Mw8.8, Maule
(WIT Transactions on State-of-the-art in Science and Engineering) contains a lot of information that you can
study it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This specific book exist new knowledge the
information that exist in this book represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to
be aware of how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you throughout new era of the
the positive effect. You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you
want.

Robert Price:

The book untitled The Chilean Earthquake and Tsunami 2010: A Multidisciplinary Study of Mw8.8, Maule
(WIT Transactions on State-of-the-art in Science and Engineering) contain a lot of information on the idea.
The writer explains the woman idea with easy method. The language is very simple to implement all the
people, so do certainly not worry, you can easy to read that. The book was compiled by famous author. The
author will bring you in the new era of literary works. It is possible to read this book because you can keep
reading your smart phone, or model, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. In a
situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can available their official web-site along with order it. Have
a nice read.

Anne Simons:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our expertise for everything. By a publication we can know
everything you want. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year ended
up being exactly added. This publication The Chilean Earthquake and Tsunami 2010: A Multidisciplinary
Study of Mw8.8, Maule (WIT Transactions on State-of-the-art in Science and Engineering) was filled
regarding science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your scientific research competence.



Some people has distinct feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big good thing about a
book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a reserve. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book
which you wanted.
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