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Between the ongoing recession, the collapse of the housing market, and the crumbling of the middle class,
many Americans are left wondering what happened to the American Dream. They’re also wondering what
happened to their money. For millions of people, just making ends meet is challenging enough. So when it
comes to saving and investing, it seems like the deck is stacked against you.

The bad news is that you’re right. If the economy were a card game, the dealer would hold all the aces. But
the good news is that you don’t have to play by the house rules. Renowned for his unvarnished insight on
finance and investing, money manager Mark Grimaldi has a reputation for telling it like it is. He doesn’t
sugarcoat the negative and he doesn’t have time for the financial industry hype that leads to bad investing
decisions. Here’s the truth: the economy is in bad shape, but that doesn’t mean you can’t save responsibly,
invest profitably, and retire comfortably.

In The Money Compass, Grimaldi teams up with accounting professor G. Stevenson Smith to offer a wealth
of smart investing advice for today’s investor. This plain-English guide to good investing presents practical
strategies and actionable advice for safely navigating today’s financial markets. It shows you how to manage
credit and debt responsibly, how to use the tax code to your advantage, which kinds of trendy investing
advice you should ignore, and where to put your money for solid returns.

In addition, the authors explore the hard macroeconomic realities that explain how we got here and where
we’re going next. They look at the primary causes and consequences of the recession, the housing crash, the
slow collapse of government programs, long-term unemployment, and how it all impacts you and your
money. Plus, Grimaldi and Stevenson forecast the next big economic shock and show you how to profit from
it. 

The economic game is rigged to keep you poor and keep Wall Street rich. So it’s time to write your own
rules. Whether you’re white collar, blue collar, or somewhere in between, The Money Compass gives you the
commonsense guidance you need to chart a course to a comfortable financial future—even in the roughest
economic waters.
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From reader reviews:

Victor Elam:

With other case, little men and women like to read book The Money Compass: Where Your Money Went
and How to Get It Back. You can choose the best book if you'd prefer reading a book. Given that we know
about how is important some sort of book The Money Compass: Where Your Money Went and How to Get
It Back. You can add information and of course you can around the world with a book. Absolutely right,
since from book you can realize everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you will find
yourself known. About simple point until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, we can
easily open a book or searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel bored
to go to the library. Let's examine.

Lisa Buffington:

This The Money Compass: Where Your Money Went and How to Get It Back book is not really ordinary
book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book is
usually information inside this book incredible fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper a person read
a lot of information you will get. This The Money Compass: Where Your Money Went and How to Get It
Back without we realize teach the one who examining it become critical in considering and analyzing. Don't
be worry The Money Compass: Where Your Money Went and How to Get It Back can bring whenever you
are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' grow to be full because you can have it inside your
lovely laptop even telephone. This The Money Compass: Where Your Money Went and How to Get It Back
having very good arrangement in word and also layout, so you will not sense uninterested in reading.

Joyce Shryock:

Reading a book being new life style in this season; every people loves to examine a book. When you go
through a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge,
simply because book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds
of book that you have read. If you wish to get information about your analysis, you can read education
books, but if you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these us novel, comics, and also
soon. The The Money Compass: Where Your Money Went and How to Get It Back provide you with new
experience in looking at a book.

Barbara Kelley:

Guide is one of source of expertise. We can add our information from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen require book to know the update information of year to year. As we know those ebooks have
many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world. By book The
Money Compass: Where Your Money Went and How to Get It Back we can take more advantage. Don't
someone to be creative people? To get creative person must like to read a book. Just choose the best book



that suited with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life by this book The Money Compass: Where Your
Money Went and How to Get It Back. You can more pleasing than now.
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