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From Pulitzer Prize–winning journalist and bestselling author Ron Suskind comes a startling look at how
America lost its way and at the nation's struggle, day by day, to reclaim the moral authority upon which its
survival depends. From the White House to Downing Street, from the fault-line countries of South Asia to
the sands of Guantánamo, Suskind offers an astonishing story that connects world leaders to the forces
waging today's shadow wars and to the next generation of global citizens. Tracking down truth and hope
within the Beltway and far beyond it, Suskind delivers historic disclosures with this emotionally stirring and
strikingly original portrait of the post-9/11 world.

In a sweeping, propulsive, and multilayered narrative, The Way of the World investigates how America
relinquished the moral leadership it now desperately needs to fight the real threat of our era: a nuclear
weapon in the hands of terrorists. Truth, justice, and accountability become more than mere words in this
story. Suskind shows where the most neglected dangers lie in the story of "The Armageddon Test" —a
desperate gamble to send undercover teams into the world's nuclear black market to frustrate the efforts of
terrorists trying to procure weapons-grade uranium. In the end, he finally reveals for the first time the
explosive falsehood underlying the Iraq War and the entire Bush presidency.

While the public and political realms struggle, The Way of the World simultaneously follows an ensemble of
characters in America and abroad who are turning fear and frustration into a desperate—and often
daring—brand of human salvation. They include a striving, twenty-four-year-old Pakistani émigré, a fearless
UN refugee commissioner, an Afghan teenager, a Holocaust survivor's son, and Benazir Bhutto, who
discovers, days before her death, how she's been abandoned by the United States at her moment of greatest
need. They are all testing American values at a time of peril, and discovering solutions—human
solutions—to so much that has gone wrong.

For anyone hoping to exercise truly informed consent and begin the process of restoring the values and
hope—along with the moral clarity and earned optimism—at the heart of the American tradition, The Way of
the World is a must-read.
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From reader reviews:

Geneva Milbourn:

This book untitled The Way of the World to be one of several books that will best seller in this year, this is
because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit into it. You will easily to buy that book in
the book store or you can order it via online. The publisher with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you
more easily to read this book, since you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason to
your account to past this publication from your list.

Lillie Granado:

The reserve with title The Way of the World contains a lot of information that you can understand it. You
can get a lot of profit after read this book. This kind of book exist new understanding the information that
exist in this e-book represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to find out
how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you in new era of the syndication. You can read the
e-book on your smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Eva Solares:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book ended up being rare?
Why so many problem for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes
reading through, not only science book but novel and The Way of the World or others sources were given
know-how for you. After you know how the great a book, you feel want to read more and more. Science e-
book was created for teacher as well as students especially. Those books are helping them to increase their
knowledge. In different case, beside science guide, any other book likes The Way of the World to make your
spare time a lot more colorful. Many types of book like this one.

Arthur Warnick:

Some people said that they feel uninterested when they reading a publication. They are directly felt it when
they get a half areas of the book. You can choose the actual book The Way of the World to make your
reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading ability is developing when you including reading. Try to
choose basic book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the opinion about book and looking at especially.
It is to be initial opinion for you to like to open a book and examine it. Beside that the reserve The Way of
the World can to be your brand new friend when you're truly feel alone and confuse using what must you're
doing of this time.
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